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Sealy Corp. v. Commissioner, 107 T. C. 177 (1996)

Regulatory compliance costs do not qualify as specified liability losses eligible for a
10-year net operating loss carryback under IRC Section 172(f)(1)(B).

Summary

Sealy Corporation sought to carry back net operating losses from 1989 to 1992 as
specified liability losses under IRC Section 172(f)(1)(B), which would allow a 10-year
carryback instead of the usual 3 years. The losses stemmed from costs to comply
with the Securities and Exchange Act, ERISA, and IRS audits. The Tax Court held
that these compliance costs did not qualify as specified liability losses because they
did not arise directly under federal law but from Sealy’s contractual obligations with
service providers. The court emphasized that the 10-year carryback is intended for a
narrow  class  of  liabilities  similar  to  product  liability,  tort  losses,  and  nuclear
decommissioning costs.

Facts

Sealy  Corporation  incurred  net  operating  losses  from  1989  to  1992  due  to
deductible expenses for complying with various federal regulations. These included
costs for preparing SEC filings under the Securities and Exchange Act of 1934,
auditing employee benefit plans under ERISA, and accounting and legal fees for IRS
audits.  Sealy attempted to carry these losses back to 1985 as specified liability
losses under IRC Section 172(f)(1)(B), which allows a 10-year carryback for certain
liabilities.

Procedural History

Sealy filed motions for partial summary judgment in the U. S. Tax Court, seeking a
ruling  that  its  compliance  costs  qualified  as  specified  liability  losses.  The
Commissioner of Internal Revenue opposed the motion, arguing that these costs did
not meet the statutory requirements. The Tax Court denied Sealy’s motions, holding
that the compliance costs were not specified liability losses.

Issue(s)

1. Whether Sealy’s costs of complying with the Securities and Exchange Act, ERISA,
and IRS audits qualify as liabilities arising under federal law as required by IRC
Section 172(f)(1)(B).
2.  Whether  the  acts  or  failures  to  act  giving  rise  to  Sealy’s  compliance  costs
occurred at least 3 years before the taxable years at issue, as required by IRC
Section 172(f)(1)(B)(i).

Holding

1. No, because Sealy’s liability to pay for these services did not arise directly under
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federal law but from contractual obligations with service providers.
2. No, because the acts or failures to act giving rise to the compliance costs did not
occur at least 3 years before the taxable years at issue.

Court’s Reasoning

The court reasoned that for an expense to be a specified liability loss under IRC
Section  172(f)(1)(B),  it  must  arise  directly  under  federal  or  state  law.  Sealy’s
compliance  costs  were  incurred  due  to  contractual  agreements  with  service
providers, not directly from the regulatory statutes themselves. The court also noted
that the 10-year carryback provision is intended for a narrow class of liabilities, such
as product liability and tort losses, which are distinct from routine compliance costs.
The court further supported its decision by referencing the legislative history, which
linked the specified liability loss rule to the economic performance rules under IRC
Section 461(h). Since Sealy’s compliance costs were not deferred by these economic
performance  rules,  they  did  not  qualify  for  the  10-year  carryback.  The  court
concluded that Sealy’s compliance costs did not meet the statutory requirements for
specified liability losses.

Practical Implications

This decision clarifies that routine regulatory compliance costs, even if required by
federal  law,  do  not  qualify  as  specified  liability  losses  under  IRC  Section
172(f)(1)(B).  Taxpayers  seeking  to  carry  back  net  operating  losses  beyond  the
standard 3-year period must demonstrate that their losses stem from liabilities that
arise directly under federal  or state law, not from contractual  obligations.  This
ruling may impact how businesses structure their compliance activities and plan for
tax loss carrybacks. It also underscores the importance of understanding the specific
categories of losses eligible for extended carrybacks, as outlined in the statute and
its legislative history. Subsequent cases have cited Sealy in distinguishing between
direct statutory liabilities and indirect costs of compliance.


