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Kieu v. Commissioner, 105 T. C. 387 (1995)

Vacating  a  bankruptcy  court’s  order  denying  discharge  does  not  automatically
reinstate the automatic stay terminated by that denial.

Summary

In Kieu v. Commissioner, the U. S. Tax Court determined that the automatic stay,
which prohibits actions against a debtor in bankruptcy, was terminated when a
bankruptcy court denied the debtor’s discharge. The central  issue was whether
vacating this denial would reinstate the automatic stay. The court held that once
terminated, the automatic stay does not automatically resume unless the bankruptcy
court explicitly states otherwise.  This ruling affects how attorneys handle cases
where bankruptcy court decisions are appealed or modified, ensuring clarity on
when the stay is in effect.

Facts

Chan Q. Kieu and Quynh Kieu filed for Chapter 7 bankruptcy on October 21, 1993.
On March 14, 1994, the IRS issued a notice of deficiency for their 1989 taxes. On
November 1, 1994, the bankruptcy court ruled that all of the Kieu’s debts were
nondischargeable under 11 U. S. C. § 727, effectively terminating the automatic
stay. The Kieu’s filed a petition with the Tax Court on December 12, 1994. On
January 23, 1995, the bankruptcy court vacated its November 1 order but did not
mention reinstating the automatic stay.

Procedural History

The Kieu’s filed for bankruptcy in October 1993. In March 1994, the IRS issued a
notice  of  deficiency.  The  bankruptcy  court  ruled  debts  nondischargeable  in
November 1994, terminating the automatic stay. The Kieu’s filed a petition with the
Tax Court in December 1994. The bankruptcy court vacated its November order in
January 1995. The Tax Court issued an order to show cause in July 1995, leading to
the ruling in December 1995.

Issue(s)

1. Whether the bankruptcy court’s order denying the Kieu’s discharge terminated
the automatic stay under 11 U. S. C. § 362(c)(2)(C)?
2. Whether the subsequent vacating of the denial order by the bankruptcy court
reinstated the automatic stay?

Holding

1. Yes, because the denial of discharge under 11 U. S. C. § 727 terminated the
automatic stay as per the statute’s plain language.
2. No, because vacating the denial did not automatically reinstate the stay; the stay
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remained terminated absent an express indication from the bankruptcy court to the
contrary.

Court’s Reasoning

The Tax Court analyzed the Bankruptcy Code’s language, particularly 11 U. S. C. §
362(c)(2)(C), which specifies that the automatic stay terminates upon the denial of
discharge.  The  court  rejected  the  argument  that  vacating  the  denial  order
retroactively nullified the termination of the stay, citing Allison v. Commissioner and
other precedents. The court emphasized that if the bankruptcy court intended to
reinstate the stay, it should have explicitly done so. The court also noted that the
automatic  stay  prevents  duplicative  litigation,  but  the  absence  of  clear
reinstatement  language  meant  the  stay  remained  terminated.

Practical Implications

This decision clarifies that once the automatic stay is terminated by a bankruptcy
court’s denial of discharge, it does not automatically resume upon vacating that
order. Practitioners must ensure explicit language reinstating the stay is included in
any vacating order to avoid confusion. This ruling impacts how attorneys manage
cases involving bankruptcy appeals or modifications, ensuring they understand the
stay’s  status.  Subsequent  cases  like  Allison  v.  Commissioner  have  applied  this
principle, reinforcing its importance in legal practice.


