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Herman v. Commissioner, 84 T. C. 120 (1985)

Payments  for  subordinated  loan  certificates  (SLCs)  required  to  obtain  medical
malpractice  insurance  are  not  deductible  as  ordinary  and  necessary  business
expenses but are capital expenditures.

Summary

New Jersey physicians faced a crisis in obtaining medical malpractice insurance,
leading  to  the  creation  of  a  physician-owned insurance  exchange.  To  fund the
exchange,  physicians  were  required  to  purchase  subordinated  loan  certificates
(SLCs).  The  IRS  disallowed  deductions  for  these  payments,  arguing  they  were
capital expenditures. The Tax Court agreed, ruling that SLCs were not ordinary and
necessary business expenses under IRC sec. 162(a) but capital investments with an
indefinite life. The court also determined that corporate purchases of SLCs did not
constitute dividends or additional compensation to the physicians, as the certificates
were considered corporate assets with a repayment obligation to the corporation
upon redemption.

Facts

In the mid-1970s, New Jersey physicians faced rising costs and limited availability of
medical malpractice insurance. In response, the Medical Inter-Insurance Exchange
of New Jersey (Exchange) was formed in 1976 as a physician-owned reciprocal
insurance exchange. To provide initial capital, the Exchange required physicians to
purchase subordinated loan certificates (SLCs) based on their medical specialty.
These certificates were not transferable, bore no interest, and were redeemable only
upon  a  physician’s  death,  retirement,  or  departure  from  New  Jersey.  Some
physicians and their professional corporations (P. C. s) deducted the cost of the
SLCs as business expenses. The IRS disallowed these deductions, asserting they
were capital expenditures, and also treated P. C. purchases of SLCs as dividends or
additional compensation to the physicians.

Procedural History

The IRS issued notices of deficiency for the tax year 1977, disallowing deductions
for SLC payments and including additional income as dividends or compensation.
The cases were consolidated for trial, briefing, and opinion in the U. S. Tax Court.
The court heard the cases under its small case procedures and issued its decision on
January 30, 1985.

Issue(s)

1. Whether payments by individual physicians or their P. C. s to purchase SLCs
constitute  ordinary  and  necessary  business  expenses  under  IRC sec.  162(a)  or
capital expenditures?
2. Whether payments for SLCs by a P. C. for its shareholder/employee physicians
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constitute dividends under IRC sections 301(a), 301(c), and 316(a)?
3.  Whether  the  purchase  of  SLCs  by  a  P.  C.  for  its  nonshareholder/employee
physicians constitutes additional compensation under IRC sec. 61?

Holding

1.  No,  because the payments  for  SLCs are  capital  expenditures  that  create  or
enhance a separate asset with an indefinite useful life, not ordinary and necessary
business expenses.
2. No, because the SLCs are considered corporate assets, and the physicians have
an  obligation  to  repay  the  corporation  upon  redemption,  thus  not  constituting
dividends.
3.  No,  because the SLCs are corporate assets  and do not  represent  additional
compensation to nonshareholder/employee physicians.

Court’s Reasoning

The court applied the five-part test from Commissioner v. Lincoln Savings & Loan
Association to determine deductibility under IRC sec. 162(a). It found that while the
payments  were  necessary  for  obtaining  insurance,  they  were  neither  ordinary
expenses nor expenses at all. The court reasoned that the SLCs were essentially
securities that created or enhanced a separate asset, making them capital in nature.
The court  also  rejected the IRS’s  arguments  that  corporate purchases of  SLCs
constituted dividends or additional compensation. It found that the certificates were
corporate assets, and the physicians had agreements to repay the corporation upon
redemption. The court emphasized substance over form, noting that the certificates
enabled physicians to perform their duties but did not confer an unconditional right
to the redemption proceeds.

Practical Implications

This decision clarifies that payments for instruments like SLCs, which create or
enhance separate  assets  with  an indefinite  life,  are  not  deductible  as  business
expenses. It  impacts how similar financing arrangements for insurance or other
business needs should be treated for tax purposes. Businesses and professionals
must  carefully  consider  whether  such  payments  constitute  capital  expenditures
rather than ordinary expenses. The ruling also affects how corporate purchases of
assets  for  employees  are  characterized,  emphasizing  that  such  assets  remain
corporate property if there is an obligation to repay the corporation. Subsequent
cases have followed this reasoning, reinforcing the distinction between capital and
ordinary expenditures in the context of business financing and insurance.


