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Carriage Square, Inc. v. Commissioner, 69 T. C. 119 (1977)

A partnership lacking economic substance, where capital is not a material income-
producing factor, will not be recognized for tax purposes.

Summary

Carriage Square, Inc. formed a limited partnership, Sonoma Development Company,
with five trusts, allocating 90% of profits to the trusts despite their minimal capital
contribution. The Tax Court held that Sonoma was not a valid partnership for tax
purposes  because  capital  was  not  a  material  income-producing  factor,  and  the
arrangement lacked a business purpose. The court’s decision emphasized the need
for economic substance in partnership arrangements and the importance of aligning
profit distribution with actual contributions of capital or services.

Facts

Carriage  Square,  Inc.  ,  controlled  by  Arthur  Condiotti,  established  a  limited
partnership, Sonoma Development Company, in 1969. Carriage Square contributed
$556 as the general partner, while five trusts, set up by Condiotti’s mother with
Condiotti’s  accountant  as  trustee,  each  contributed  $1,000.  Despite  the  trusts’
minimal  contribution,  they  were  allocated  90%  of  Sonoma’s  profits.  Sonoma’s
business involved purchasing land, constructing houses, and selling them, financed
largely through loans guaranteed by Condiotti. The partnership reported significant
income over three years, but the IRS challenged the allocation of income to the
trusts.

Procedural History

The IRS issued a deficiency notice to Carriage Square, Inc. ,  reallocating all  of
Sonoma’s income to Carriage Square. Carriage Square petitioned the U. S. Tax
Court, which upheld the IRS’s determination, ruling that Sonoma was not a valid
partnership  for  tax  purposes  and  that  all  income should  be  taxed  to  Carriage
Square.

Issue(s)

1. Whether the consent agreement (Form 872-A) validly extended the statute of
limitations for assessment of taxes for the years in question?
2. Whether Sonoma Development Company was a valid partnership for tax purposes,
and if not, whether all of its income should be included in Carriage Square, Inc. ‘s
gross income?

Holding

1. Yes, because Form 872-A, which allows for an indefinite extension of the statute
of limitations, was valid and had been reasonably used by the IRS.
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2.  No,  because Sonoma was not a partnership in which capital  was a material
income-producing factor, and the parties did not have a good faith business purpose
to join together as partners; therefore, all income should be included in Carriage
Square, Inc. ‘s gross income.

Court’s Reasoning

The court found that Sonoma’s partnership lacked economic substance because the
trusts’ minimal capital contribution did not justify their 90% share of profits. The
court  emphasized  that  capital  was  not  a  material  income-producing  factor,  as
Sonoma relied on borrowed funds guaranteed by Condiotti, not the partners’ capital.
Furthermore, the court held that the parties did not join together with a genuine
business purpose, as evidenced by the disproportionate allocation of profits and the
trusts’ limited liability and non-involvement in the business. The court’s decision was
supported by the principle that income should be taxed to the party who earns it
through labor, skill, or capital. The concurring opinion agreed with the outcome but
criticized the majority’s reasoning, arguing that the focus should be on the lack of
bona fide intent rather than the nature of the capital. The dissenting opinion argued
that  capital  was  a  material  income-producing  factor  and  proposed  a  different
method for allocating income based on the trusts’ capital contributions.

Practical Implications

This decision underscores the importance of  economic substance in partnership
arrangements for tax purposes. It warns against using partnerships as tax avoidance
schemes by allocating disproportionate profits without corresponding contributions
of  capital  or  services.  Practitioners  should  ensure  that  partnership  agreements
reflect  genuine  business  arrangements  and  that  profit  allocations  align  with
partners’ economic interests. The case has been cited in later decisions to support
the principle that partnerships must have a valid business purpose and economic
substance to be recognized for tax purposes. Businesses should be cautious when
structuring partnerships to ensure they withstand IRS scrutiny, particularly when
involving related parties or trusts.


