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Moses v. Commissioner, 18 T.C. 1020 (1952)

A separation agreement is not considered ‘incident to’ a later divorce decree for tax
purposes if the agreement was entered into as a substitute for divorce, especially
where one party adamantly opposed divorce at the time of the agreement.

Summary

The  Tax  Court  held  that  payments  made  to  the  petitioner  under  a  voluntary
separation agreement were not taxable as alimony because the agreement was not
‘incident to’ a later divorce decree obtained by her husband. The court emphasized
that  the wife had explicitly  refused to consent to a divorce at  the time of  the
agreement, indicating that the agreement was a substitute for, not an anticipation
of,  divorce.  This  decision  highlights  the  importance  of  the  parties’  intent  and
circumstances  surrounding  a  separation  agreement  when  determining  its
relationship  to  a  subsequent  divorce  for  tax  implications.

Facts

Albert and Evelyn Moses separated. Prior to their separation, Albert Moses wanted a
divorce and proposed it to Evelyn Moses. Evelyn rejected these proposals and stated
she  would  not  consent  to  a  divorce.  Subsequently,  Albert  Moses  agreed  to  a
voluntary separation, and Evelyn discontinued legal proceedings for separation. A
voluntary separation agreement was executed on April 4, 1944. Later, Albert Moses
obtained a divorce in Florida on October 23, 1944, and remarried the same day.

Procedural History

The Commissioner of Internal Revenue determined that payments Evelyn Moses
received under the separation agreement were taxable as alimony. Evelyn Moses
petitioned the Tax Court for a redetermination. The Tax Court ruled in favor of
Evelyn Moses, finding that the payments were not taxable income.

Issue(s)

Whether payments received by the petitioner from Albert Moses under a voluntary
separation agreement were taxable to the petitioner under Section 22(k) of the
Internal Revenue Code as payments made under a written instrument incident to a
divorce or separation.

Holding

No, because the separation agreement was not ‘incident to’ the subsequent divorce
decree obtained by Albert Moses. The agreement was entered into as a substitute
for divorce, particularly given Evelyn’s explicit refusal to consent to a divorce at the
time of the agreement.
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Court’s Reasoning

The court  reasoned that  the separation agreement was not  entered into as  an
incident to a divorce but as a substitute for a divorce or legal separation. The Tax
Court  emphasized  that  Evelyn,  advised  by  counsel,  accepted  the  separation
agreement as an alternative to a legal separation or divorce proceeding. The court
distinguished this case from others where divorce was contemplated by both parties
when  entering  the  agreement.  The  court  found  significant  that  Evelyn  had
adamantly refused to consent to a divorce and had discontinued her separation
action based on the voluntary agreement. The court stated, “It is evident from the
conduct of the parties that the voluntary agreement was not entered into as an
incident to a divorce but as a substitute for a divorce or legal separation.” The
inclusion  of  a  provision  allowing  incorporation  of  the  agreement  into  a  future
divorce decree did not automatically make the agreement incident to divorce; it was
merely a contingency provision. The court concluded that taxing the payments as
alimony would run counter to the clear weight of the evidence, as Evelyn would not
have entered the agreement if a divorce had been a consideration.

Practical Implications

This case clarifies the ‘incident to’ requirement in the context of alimony taxation. It
highlights that a separation agreement is less likely to be considered ‘incident to’ a
later divorce if it was clearly intended as a substitute for divorce, especially when
one party was strongly opposed to divorce at the time of the agreement. Attorneys
should carefully document the parties’ intentions and circumstances surrounding a
separation agreement,  particularly  regarding the prospect  of  divorce,  to ensure
accurate tax treatment of payments. This case informs the analysis of similar cases
by emphasizing the parties’ intent and actions at the time of the agreement. Later
cases  may distinguish  themselves  based on  whether  both  parties  contemplated
divorce at the time of the agreement. This decision serves as a reminder that the
mere possibility  of  a  future divorce does not  automatically  render a separation
agreement ‘incident to’ that divorce.


